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On behalf of Sacramento Waldorf School, we cordially invite you to sponsor our school’s 
annual endowment fund golf tournament, The Waldorf Cup. This year’s daytime event is 
Thursday, May 17, 2018, at Ancil Hoffman Golf Course. This exciting and fun filled event 
will include 18 holes of golf, a golf cart, a Bloody Mary bar, a driving range, a boxed lunch, a 
dinner with live music and an awards banquet with a silent auction and raffle. 
 
While our School is a tuition-based institution, we rely on fundraising events to help us reach 
our financial goals and our golf tournament and dinner is our largest endowment fund event 
of the year. In addition to raising significant funds, the golf tournament develops community 
as our guests build friendships outside of the school structure, and work together in support 
of the entire school.  
 
Established in 1959, our kindergarten through twelfth grade school is located on a scenic 22-
acre campus overlooking the American River in Fair Oaks. This beautiful setting brings the 
gifts of nature to the children, supplementing their classroom studies with access to gardens 
and woods, playing fields, a small stream, and a working farm. Focused on each student’s 
developmental needs and capacities, Waldorf education integrates the arts, music, 
movement, crafts, and drama with the disciplines of science, humanities, mathematics, and 
technology.  
 
Our mission is to prepare students to realize their highest potential as free human beings. 
We accomplish our mission by recognizing each student as a unique individual with body, 
soul, and spirit. With a deep understanding of human development, we cultivate a dynamic 
culture of community and social and emotional intelligence. The breadth and depth of our 
curriculum also connects children to nature and the farm-to-table cycle, as well as ignites a 
passion for lifelong learning. 
 
Please take a few minutes to review the sponsorship information at 
https://sacwaldorf.ejoinme.org/sponsorships or email waldorfcup@sacwaldorf.org if you 
have any questions. 
 
Many businesses find that this is an excellent opportunity to introduce their products and 
services to our community. We look forward to working with you to maximize your business 
and marketing needs.  
 
Thank you sincerely for your time and consideration,  

SWS Sponsorship Team 
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